
$598,000 - 1178 FRASERBURG Road
 

Listing ID: 40571409

$598,000
3 Bedrooms, 1 Bathrooms, 10.88 acres
Single Family

1178 FRASERBURG Road, Bracebridge,
Ontario, P1L0G9

Location, location, location! This 10+ acre
rural property with Sharpes Creek and 1996
raised bungalow is only 2 minutes to town
on a well maintained year-round road. With
1056sqft, 3 bedrooms, 1 bathroom and a full
partially finished basement this home has
many great applications including potential
in-law suite. The Den in the basement
provides additional sleeping quarters for
overflow guests and there is excellent
development potential throughout. Newer
rental furnace and A/C provide hassle free
heating and cooling with 24/7 on call
service and annual maintenance for only
$156/month. There is a long driveway with
the home set back from the road atop a flat
plateau, great for privacy, quiet and parking
with over 15+ car parking and a circular
drive so you do not have to back out onto
the road. Lots of room for all your toys,
RV's, boats, storage buildings and plenty of
space for a future garage build. Landscaped
and partially cleared with natural
greenspace along the creek which wraps
around the neighboring home. Live, work
and play from home at this excellent rural
residence close to town! (id:50245)
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$598,000 - 1178 FRASERBURG Road
 

Listing Office:Re/Max Professionals North, Brokerage, Gravenhurst
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