
$799,900 - 74 ROBERT Street S
 

Listing ID: 40574711

$799,900
4 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 1941.8
Single Family

74 ROBERT Street S, Wasaga Beach,
Ontario, L9Z2Y2

Welcome to 74 Robert Street South! This
charming home is tucked away on a quiet
dead-end street, just a short stroll from the
shores of Georgian Bay. Minutes away from
Collingwood, Wasaga’s Casino, and
Highway 26, its location is ideal. Inside,
you'll find two bedrooms on the main level
and two spacious bedrooms in the finished
basement. Upgrades abound, with upgraded
lighting and pot lights throughout the house.
The kitchen features beautiful quartz
countertops, perfect for meal prep or
entertaining. California shutters add a touch
of elegance to the windows. This move-in-
ready property sits on a large, private lot,
providing plenty of space for outdoor
activities or relaxation. A detached garage
offers convenient parking and storage. Other
bonuses include stainless steel appliances
and a new laundry setup. Don't miss out on
this fantastic opportunity! (id:50245)
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