
$555,000 - 2460 FRED JONES Road
 

Listing ID: 40579583

$555,000
3 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 1.87 acres
Single Family

2460 FRED JONES Road, Haliburton,
Ontario, K0M1S0

Welcome to 2460 Fred Jones Road, a
charming 4-season waterfront retreat on
Beaver's Pond. This delightful turn-key
home boasts a warm and inviting interior
that perfectly blends charm and
contemporary finishes highlighted by pine
ceilings and maple floors throughout. Inside
you will find 3 bedrooms, 2 bathrooms and
2 living rooms, great for hosting gatherings.
Relax by the woodstove in the living room
on chilly days to soak up the ambiance of
the space. One of the highlights of this
house is the enclosed sunroom offering
beautiful views of the water, providing a
perfect setting for relaxation. Step outside to
immerse yourself in the natural beauty
surrounding this home, highlighted by the
view of the pond, which promises peace and
privacy. Additionally, the property includes
a separate bunkie, perfect for hosting extra
guests. Beyond the comforts of home, this
property is conveniently located in close
proximity to the village of Haliburton.
There, you will find a variety of amenities
including, shops, restaurants and
recreational facilities. Whether you're
looking for a family home or a getaway, this
property offers a perfect setting for creating
lasting memories in the Haliburton
Highlands. (id:50245)
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