
$449,900 - 294 NINE MILE LAKE Island
 

Listing ID: 40585865

$449,900
2 Bedrooms, 1 Bathrooms, 1.39 acres
Single Family

294 NINE MILE LAKE Island, Torrance,
Ontario, P0C1M0

Welcome to the shores of 294 Nine Mile
Lake in the Heart of Muskoka. This very
private boat access 1.39 acre property boasts
180' of gorgeous Muskoka shoreline with
lovely rock outcroppings and tall trees. Nine
Mile lake is one of Muskoka's best kept
secrets. The property abuts crown land
lending to acres and acres to explore and
enjoy with ponds, streams, rivers and
waterfalls all in your backyard. Enjoy sun
all day on your newer floating dock and
retreat in the evenings to the cottage to relax
and unwind. The well appointed 2 bedroom
1 bath insulated cottage comes completely
turn key. Having been recently updated
from electrical, kitchen, windows, new
fireplace and more all you need to do is
bring your bag and enjoy. Perched
overlooking the lake the views from the
cottage are nothing short of beautiful
offering up all day sun and some of the most
spectacular sunrises in Muskoka. With over
half of the lake being crown land Nine Mile
is where peace and tranquility can be found
again in Muskoka. To complete the package
there is a 10' x 8' storage shed that can
easily be a Bunkie for extra guests,
generator included and water toys! Call,
text, or email for more details! (id:50245)
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