
$749,000 - 27 BEAUMONT BAY Road
 

Listing ID: 40586790

$749,000
2 Bedrooms, 1 Bathrooms, 0.98 acres
Single Family

27 BEAUMONT BAY Road, Utterson,
Ontario, P0B1L0

Discover the serene beauty of Skeleton Lake
with this enchanting three-season cottage,
perfectly positioned to capture breathtaking
sunsets with its desirable western exposure.
This cottage features an open-concept
kitchen, two cozy bedrooms, and a spacious
4-piece bathroom. The living room, adorned
with large windows, offers panoramic views
of the lake and includes a wood stove for
those chillier summer evenings. Step outside
onto the spacious deck, an ideal retreat for
your morning coffee or evening cocktails.
The natural landscape is highlighted by
granite outcroppings and majestic towering
pines, creating a tranquil backdrop. The
property includes a single-slip dock for
boating enthusiasts and the pristine waters
of Skeleton Lake are perfect for swimming,
with a sandy lakebed providing comfort
underfoot. This move-in-ready cottage
awaits. (id:50245)
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