
$2,345,000 - 160 GRAND CYPRESS Lane
 

Listing ID: 40590900

$2,345,000
4 Bedrooms, 5 Bathrooms, 0.45 acres
Single Family

160 GRAND CYPRESS Lane, The Blue
Mountains, Ontario, L9Y0K8

Welcome to your own slice of paradise at
160 Grand Cypress Ln, nestled in the heart
of the lovely Blue Mountains! This
luxurious retreat boasts over 4900 sq ft of
finished space, 4 beds (plus loft) & 5 baths,
offering ample space & comfort for you &
your loved ones to unwind & indulge in the
ultimate resort-style living. Step outside &
discover a world of outdoor oasis, where
every day feels like a vacation. Take a dip in
the refreshing in-ground pool, soak away
your cares in the soothing hot tub, or
indulge in the tranquil warmth of the cedar
barrel sauna. Lounge under the sun or seek
shade in the charming Tiki bar, perfect for
hosting unforgettable gatherings w/ friends
& family. As the sun sets, gather around the
fire pit & let the crackling flames set the
scene for cozy evenings spent making
memories under the stars. Listen to the
soothing sounds of the pond & waterfall,
creating a serene backdrop for relaxation &
reflection. Inside, you'll find a meticulously
designed home boasting luxurious finishes
& thoughtful touches throughout. Offering a
unique layout full of potential. From the
gourmet kitchen w/ double island, high end
appliances & vaulted ceilings, where
culinary dreams come to life, to the
gorgeous great room w/ exposed beams &
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oversized fireplace & loads of natural light,
to the spacious bedrooms offering peaceful
retreats at the end of the day, every detail
has been carefully curated to elevate your
lifestyle. Stunning hill views from primary
bed! Located in one of the most sought-after
communities in the Blue Mountains, this
exquisite property offers the perfect blend of
privacy & convenience. Explore nearby
hiking trails, hit the slopes at Blue Mountain
Resort, or simply enjoy the breathtaking
views of the surrounding natural beauty.
Don't miss your chance to own this
unparalleled sanctuary in the heart of the
Blue Mountains. Experience resort-style
living like never before! Offers rental
income potential, multi-generational living,
nanny suite! (id:50245)
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