
$639,900 - 27 BEAVER Street Unit# 302
 

Listing ID: 40596372

$639,900
2 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 1451
Single Family

27 BEAVER Street Unit# 302, Thornbury,
Ontario, N0H2P0

Prime location, walking distance to
downtown Thornbury! Welcome to 27
Beaver St., # 302 located on the top floor of
a 3 storey building (elevator) which offers
higher ceilings. This immaculate 1 level
suite is spacious throughout. Featuring a
beautifully updated kitchen with functional
centre island. Offering stainless steel
Maytag fridge, microwave, stove and Bosch
dishwasher. Double sink and new solid
surface countertops (2023). The living room
is a great space to gather after a day at the
golf course. Enjoy evenings on the patio
whilst watching the sunset. Primary bdrm.
has walk-in closet & 5 piece ensuite incl.
whirlpool tub. Guest bdrm ideal for guests
or as a home office. LG Washer/dryer
located in storage rm. Pull down blinds &
Shutters as well. The community clubhouse
located across the street features pickleball/
tennis courts, outdoor pool, library, gym,
pool table and kitchen! Parking spot
w/locker ideally located in underground
garage. This property is a must see. Book
your private viewing to see what living in
Thornbury has to offer! (id:50245)
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