
$699,900 - 890 COUNTY RD 6 Road N
 

Listing ID: 40609184

$699,900
4 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 1.33 acres
Single Family

890 COUNTY RD 6 Road N, Tiny, Ontario,
L9M0R3

Fantastic property offering something for
everyone. The property has been well cared
for over the past 40 + years by the same
owner. The property is a level and well
cared for 1.33 acre corner lot with access off
of two roads to a large driveway for all your
vehicles and toys. The home features: Eat-In
Country Kitchen * Living Room * Sunroom
* 4 M/F Bedrooms * M/F Laundry * 2
Baths * M/F Hot Tub Room * Mud Room *
Rec Room with gas Fireplace & Wet Bar *
Office * Plenty of Storage * Propane
Furnace w/AC * 3 Single Car Garages *
Newer 21 x 21 Garage/Shop heated,
insulated, panel, and wired for Welder * 15
x 36 Garage for Boat/RV * Enclosed
Gazebo * 2 Spacious Storage Sheds * Small
Pond * 30 x 30 fenced area perfect for pets
or children. Plus much more. Located in
North Simcoe and offers so much to do -
boating, fishing, swimming, canoeing,
hiking, cycling, hunting, snowmobiling,
atving, golfing, skiing and along with
theatres, historical tourist attractions and so
much more. Only 5 minutes to Penetang, 15
minutes to Midland, 40 minutes to Orillia,
40 minutes to Barrie and 90 minutes from
GTA. (id:50245)
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