
$828,000 - 70 CROCKAMHILL Drive
 

Listing ID: 40611829

$828,000
3 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 1550
Single Family

70 CROCKAMHILL Drive, Scarborough,
Ontario, M1S3H1

Agincourt North A prominent and well
recognized artists home. All the art on
display is for sale. This 3 bedroom, 2 bath
Town Home has an Eatin Kitchen, 2 baths,
Spacious Living and Dining room. Walkout
to a large and sunny private balcony from
Living and Dining room. Walkout to private
treed patio from lower level family room.
High end multi operational windows from
Germany. The Best feature of this property
the treed yard for privacy and lush backdrop
for entertaining, this sets this home apart
from the other homes in this complex. The
trees planted 20 years ago have made the
garden evolve into what it is today! Condo
Fees $335 includes WATER, snow removal
to the door and lawn maintenance. 1 Car
garage, 1 Car in driveway and across from
visitor parking! Floor plans, home
inspection and condo documents available.
Great for a professional couple or a family.
Close to 4 parks, schools and easy walk to
transit. 5 minute drive to all your shopping
and dining needs...Welcome to 70
Crockamhill Drive unit 74. Huntingwood Dr
, East of Midland. (id:50245)
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