
$699,000 - 24 RAMBLINGS Way Unit# 701
 

Listing ID: 40612670

$699,000
2 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 1291
Single Family

24 RAMBLINGS Way Unit# 701,
Collingwood, Ontario, L9Y5C6

Discover the epitome of luxury living in this
spacious corner unit featuring 2 bedrooms
and 2 bathrooms, including a primary suite
with an ensuite bath. Bathed in natural light,
the residence boasts recent updates such as
new flooring, new kitchen cabinets,
countertops, and a full suite of modern
appliances including a wine fridge and
induction stove. Floor-to-ceiling windows
frame breathtaking views of the local ski
hills, captivating sunsets, and a glimpse of
Georgian Bay. Enhancing the living space, a
generous patio invites outdoor relaxation.
Additional amenities include in-suite
laundry and ample storage options. Nestled
within the esteemed Ruperts Landing
community, residents enjoy exclusive
access to private pickleball courts, tennis
courts, a squash/basketball court, indoor
swimming pool, sauna, and hot tub. Adding
to its allure, the property features a private
marina with available slips, offering
unparalleled waterfront access. Don’t miss
your chance to own a piece of this
remarkable lifestyle opportunity. (id:50245)
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