
$499,000 - 817 SCHUTT Road
 

Listing ID: 40615112

$499,000
4 Bedrooms, 1 Bathrooms, 95.78 acres
Single Family

817 SCHUTT Road, Palmer Rapids,
Ontario, K0J2E0

A 96-acre farm with six fields that are ready
to be cultivated. The view from the back
corner of the property overlooks the valley
and is stunning with Leidtke Lake being the
star. Roam the property and go from cedar
forests, to hardwood, to the farm fields.
Several outbuildings including a chicken
coop, small-animal stable barn, drive shed
and more dot the property. Two brand new
adorable bunkies with lofts are ready for
guests. The main farmhouse needs a
considerable amount of work, but some new
upgrades include a UV water filtration
system, new electrical panel in the summer
kitchen, outlets added to the bedrooms, new
sump pump and jet pump, and new electric
wall heaters. Repair the current home or
build something new - the choice is yours.
No matter the choice, this property will not
disappoint. Located east of Bancroft, in the
neighbourhood of Schutt, with the
community of Palmer Rapids just ten
minutes away. The famous Madawaska
River flows through Palmer Rapids and is a
popular water-enthusiast destination.
(id:50245)
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