
$1,225,000 - 2 TORONTO Street Unit# 1011
 

Listing ID: 40616865

$1,225,000
2 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 1614
Single Family

2 TORONTO Street Unit# 1011, Barrie,
Ontario, L4N9R2

Discover the epitome of luxury living in this
exquisitely updated two-bedroom two-bath
condo located in Barrie's iconic Grand
Harbour. The thoughtfully designed layout
of this suite is perfect for entertaining,
whether you're gathering in the stunning
kitchen or relaxing in the spacious open
living room flooded with natural light from
the nearly floor-to-ceiling windows. The
spacious primary bedroom boasts ample
natural light and storage, complete with a
walk-in closet leading to the generous
master ensuite. The second bedroom is
equally inviting, featuring abundant natural
light and an additional full bath. Begin and
end your day in style on the glass-enclosed
balcony, offering breathtaking views of
Kempenfelt Bay, the marina, and the
dazzling city lights dancing on the water's
surface. Experience waterfront living at its
finest in this breathtaking sanctuary.
(id:50245)
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